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1 What's New

The following table describes the features released in each Resource Access
Manager (RAM) version and corresponding documentation updates.

April 2025
No. Feature Description Phas

e
Related
Documents

1 Sharing
resources

Resource owners can share
specified resources with
specified entities (including
organizations,
organizational units, and
accounts), and also update
or delete resource shares at
any time.
They can view the
information about the
shared resources and the
principals associated with
the resource shares.

OBT Sharing Your
Resources

2 Using shared
resources

Principals can accept or
reject resource sharing
invitations, and leave
resource shares after the
sharing ends.
They can also view the
information about the
shared resources and
resource owners.

OBT Using Shared
Resources
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3 Sharing with
Organizations

When RAM has become a
trusted service for
Organizations, resource
owners can share specified
resources with an
organization or
organizational units.

OBT Enabling
Sharing with
Organizations

4 Viewing the
RAM
permissions
library

You can view details about
all RAM permissions
available for different
resource types in the RAM
permissions library.

OBT Viewing the
RAM
Permissions
Library
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